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IBM is the largest technology and consulting
employer in the world, serving clients in 170
countries. In this new era of Cognitive Business,
IBM is helping to reshape industries by bringing
together our expertise in Cloud, Analytics, Security,
Mobile, and the Internet of Things. We are changing
how we create. How we collaborate. How we
analyse. How we engage. IBM is a leader in this
global transformation so there is no better place to
launch your career.

IBM’s consulting business is looking for bright and
inspired graduates to join Consulting by Degrees,
our world-class development program. A 2 year
program designed to help new consultants become
tomorrow's leaders.

The Consulting by Degrees program targets high
performers and provides focused training, one-on-
one mentoring, career guidance, and practical
experience to help you gain the expertise and
know-how that you need to become tomorrow’s
leaders.

As an IBM Consultant, you’ll help your clients
transform their businesses by helping them to see
new opportunities, respond to change and find
smarter ways of operating.
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Job Title Job ID

Business
Transformation
Consultant

125890BR

https://www.facebook.com/IBMJobsGlobal/
https://twitter.com/IBMJobsGlobal
https://www.instagram.com/ibm/
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCR5BXqVJbHz2qiiSFiZqTGA
https://www.linkedin.com/company/1009/
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